
ACROSS
1 With 65 across: City

where you can see
the Eiffel
Colosseum? (1)

5 Player of tracks with
repetitive beats and
synthesizers at a
party (abbr.)

10 "Law & Order: SVU"
actor

14 Orchestra tuner
15 Large rock in the

middle of Australia
16 Town on the island

of Sicily that is also
an anagram of ROAN

17 City with the largest
plaza de toros in the
world made famous
by a Psy music
video? (4)

19 What you get when
you reverse a lime

20 "Do not ___. Do not
collect $200"

21 Small basin next to a
dentist's chair

23 Spanish appetizer
25 "___ much as is

sufficient for thee"
(Prov. 25:16, KJV)

26 "___ alaykum"
(Arabic greeting that
translates as "Peace
be upon you")

30 Knowledge of the
eternal forms or
ideas

33 "Cyprus" in
Slovakian

34 "Can we have ___?"
(request in a
restaurant)

36 Poem of praise
37 "Three" in Lithuanian
38 Author of "The City &

the City", ___ Mieville
39 Grasp firmly
40 "Goose" in French
41 First word of "the old

Lie" according to
Wilfred Owen

42 "Good" in Italian

43 Josh ___, of "How I
Met Your Mother"

45 Track 3 of Jacob
Collier's amazing
debut album, "In My
Room"

47 Identifies

49 Precious

50 Angry mood

53 Orange-red food
coloring derived
from the seeds of
the achiote tree
(var.)

57 Like a ___ to a flame

58 City built on the
confluence of the
Thames and the
Yamuna? (5)

60 Hawaiian island

61 Suffix with trave- or
mono-

62 Architectural feature
of St. Peter's
Basilica

63 Third child of Eddard
and Catelyn Stark
who (spoiler alert)
kills the Night King
during the Battle of
Winterfell

64 Javelin

65 See 1 across

DOWN
1 Elgar's "___ and

Circumstance"

2 Rhyming scheme for
the quatrain that
ends a villanelle

3 Monica's brother on
"Friends"

4 Antares and
Betelgeuse

5 Moon of Jupiter

6 Title of R.E.M.'s
rarities and B-sides
collection (and then
abbreviated)

7 Flood residues or
spa supplies

8 Fruit with a stone

9 Actress, ___
Margulies of "ER"
and "The Good Wife"

10 Actually

11 City overlooked by
the Pyramids of Red
Square? (3)

12 "___ go Bragh"
(Ireland forever!)

13 With 50 down: City
known as the capital
of Sumo Tlachtli? (6)

18 "Equals" in
Romanian

22 Thanks To Original
Uploader (abbr.)

24 Gian Carlo Menotti's
one act opera, "___
and the Night
Visitors"

26 43 across, for
example

27 Country ranked last
on the Global Peace
Index from 2016 to
2018

28 City known for its
Opera House built on
the Swan River? (2)

29 Ann Arbor sch.
which boasts
Christine Lahti,
Selma Blair, and
Lucy Liu as alumni

31 ___ Menzel, who
sang "Let It Go"

32 Professional Indian
infantryman in the
armies of the
Mughal Empire

35 Virgil's epic poem
(var.)

38 Remedies for every
disease

39 Jazz pianist Vince
___, whose trio did
the music for "A
Charlie Brown
Christmas"

41 Common typo made
when one attempts
to text the word
"don't"

42 Longest-running
weekly comic-book

44 Gaffer tape brand
that has the same
first four letters as
the Asian pear

46 ___ than a door nail

48 Condescend

50 See 13 down

51 Crowd sound

52 Tom Cruise and
Emily Blunt film, "___
of Tomorrow"

54 Lead singer of
Radiohead, ___ Yorke

55 Cyndi Lauper song,
"___ After ___"

56 Small bills

59 The USA, to Macron
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